
Denmark, SC 
This excellent property has all 
the bones to be a great 
getaway. Nearly 300 acres to 
work with, Holmans Bridge 
Plantation offers an 8 acre 
bass pond, 25 acres of old 
fields, mature upland pines, 
upland hardwoods, and 

mature bottomland 
hardwoods. The opportunity 
for making memories is 
certainly here. The 2 bed 1 
bath home features a new 
roof (replaced in July 2021) 
and fresh interior paint. This is 
a great spot to relax while on 

a weekend getaway with 
family or friends. The tractor 
shed, shop, and bird pen are 
sound. Turkey, deer, and fish 
are plentiful. This is a great 
opportunity to own one that 
has it all for under a million. 
Shown by Appointment Only.

HOLMANS BRIDGE PLANTATION  
Available for Purchase  
Jason Hewett           $998,000 
843-247-2009 
@private_land_brokers 


